FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE : 01/23/10
PAGE : 007 -1
VENDOR RANKING

CALL ORDER : 007 PROPOSAL ID : E4K95-RO  PROPOSAL DESC :
LETTING DATE : 01/22/10 11:00 AM DISTRICT - 04 Maintenance of traffic along Primary roads and Interstate
SET-ASIDE : U/R CODE : 1-95 in Palm Beach County. Pay special attention to
CONTRACT TIME : 365 CALENDAR DAYS information regarding maintenance of traffic and worksite

traffic supervisor.
FINPROJ(S) : 40634947201 () F.A. NO. : N/A COUNTIES : PALM BEACH

40635047201 N/A

LOCAL NAME : PALM BEACH COUNTY ROAD NAME :
PROJ LIMITS : INTERSTATE MOT

BID BID TOTAL % OVER

RANK VENDOR NAME TYPE STATUS BID LOW BID

BOB"S BARRICADES, INC. WINNING BID $ 55,491.25 0.00%
HIGHWAY TECHNOLOGIES, INC. $ 56,316.25 1.48%
T&D HIGHWAY SERVICES LLC $ 59,902.50 7.94%
A & D"S CONSTRUCTION SERVICES L $ 60,082.25 8.27%
ACME BARRICADES LC $ 68,146.25 22.80%
TRAFFIC CONTROL PRODUCTS OF FLORIDA, INC. $ 72,281.25 30.25%
TRAFFIC SERVICES, INC. $ 74,565.00 34.37%
BON®"S BARRICADEDS, INC. $ 118,255.00 113 %

oO~NO U WN R

THE COMPUTER CALCULATED TOTAL BID PRICE IS THE OFFICIAL BID RESULTS TOTAL.ANY BIDDER WHO FEELS ADVERSELY AFFECTED BY THE DEPARTMENT'S DECISION ON THIS PROJECT MUST FILE WITH THE CLERK OF
AGENCYPROCEEDINGS, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 605 SUWANNEE STREET, ROOM 550, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0458, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF PROTEST WITHIN 72 HOURS OF POSTED NOTICE.
ADDITIONALLY, A FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST SETTING FORTH A SHORT AND PLAIN STATEMENT OF THE MATTERS ASSERTED BY THE BIDDER MUST BE FILED WITH THE CLERK OF AGENCY PROCEEDINGS WITHIN 10 DAYS OF
THE PRELIMINARY NOTICE OF PROTEST. IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 337.11, FLORIDA STATUES 120.57(3), AND DOT RULE 14-110 F.A.C., FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING AN AWARD SHALL POST WITH THE
DEPARTMENT, AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE LOWEST BID SUBMITTED WHICH BOND SHALL BE
CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT
PROCEEDINGS. FOR AN ACTION PROTESTING A BID REJECTION, OR CONTRACT AWARD THAT DOES NOT REQUIRE QUALIFICATION OF BIDDERS, THE BOND SHALL BE $2,500.00.FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME
PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHERSECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF
PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. THIS NOTICE IS NOT INTENDED AS AN ACCEPTANCE OF ANY OFFER CREATED BY SUBMISSION OF A BID, AND NO CONTRACT SHALL BE CONSIDERED TO EXIST UNTIL
REDUCED TO WRITING AND EXECUTED BY ALL PARTIES THERETO.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD WAS POSTED: 11amon 2/2/10 Lizz Holmes, Procurement Supervisor



FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE : 01/23/10
PAGE : 005 -1
VENDOR RANKING

CALL ORDER - 005 PROPOSAL ID : E4K98-RO  PROPOSAL DESC :

LETTING DATE : 01/22/10 11:00 AM DISTRICT - 04 Interstate Attenuator Repair in Broward County

SET-ASIDE : U/R CODE :

CONTRACT TIME : 365 CALENDAR DAYS Provide labor, material, equipment and incidentals necessary
to inspect, clean, repair, reset, relocate or replace
vehicular impact attenuators at various locations on the
state highway system.

Contract Coordinator: Margaret Simpkins 954-777-4612

FINPROJ(S) 1 23421647201 (*) F_A_. NO. : N/A COUNTIES : BROWARD

LOCAL NAME : BROWARD - INTERSTATE ROAD NAME :

PROJ LIMITS : ATTENUATOR REPAIR
BID BID TOTAL % OVER

RANK VENDOR NAME TYPE STATUS BID LOW BID
1  SOUTHEAST ATTENUATORS INC WINNING BID $ 191,445.00 0.00%
2  PROFESSIONAL HIGHWAY MAINTENANCE $ 436,655.00 128 %

THE COMPUTER CALCULATED TOTAL BID PRICE IS THE OFFICIAL BID RESULTS TOTAL.ANY BIDDER WHO FEELS ADVERSELY AFFECTED BY THE DEPARTMENT'S DECISION ON THIS PROJECT MUST FILE WITH THE CLERK OF
AGENCYPROCEEDINGS, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 605 SUWANNEE STREET, ROOM 550, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0458, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF PROTEST WITHIN 72 HOURS OF POSTED NOTICE.
ADDITIONALLY, A FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST SETTING FORTH A SHORT AND PLAIN STATEMENT OF THE MATTERS ASSERTED BY THE BIDDER MUST BE FILED WITH THE CLERK OF AGENCY PROCEEDINGS WITHIN 10 DAYS OF
THE PRELIMINARY NOTICE OF PROTEST. IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 337.11, FLORIDA STATUES 120.57(3), AND DOT RULE 14-110 F.A.C., FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING AN AWARD SHALL POST WITH THE
DEPARTMENT, AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE LOWEST BID SUBMITTED WHICH BOND SHALL BE
CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT
PROCEEDINGS. FOR AN ACTION PROTESTING A BID REJECTION, OR CONTRACT AWARD THAT DOES NOT REQUIRE QUALIFICATION OF BIDDERS, THE BOND SHALL BE $2,500.00.FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME
PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHERSECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF
PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. THIS NOTICE IS NOT INTENDED AS AN ACCEPTANCE OF ANY OFFER CREATED BY SUBMISSION OF A BID, AND NO CONTRACT SHALL BE CONSIDERED TO EXIST UNTIL
REDUCED TO WRITING AND EXECUTED BY ALL PARTIES THERETO.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD WAS POSTED: 11amon 2/2/10 Lizz Holmes, Procurement Supervisor



LORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE : 01/23/10
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VENDOR RANKING

CALL ORDER : 004 PROPOSAL ID : E4L02-RO PROPOSAL DESC :
LETTING DATE : 01/22/10 11:00 AM DISTRICT 1 04 Primary Sweeping in Palm Beach County. This contract has a
SET-ASIDE : U/R CODE : renewal option. The budget estimate is $200,000.
CONTRACT TIME : 365 CALENDAR DAYS
FINPROJ(S) : 40642147201 (*) F.A. NO. o N/A COUNTIES : PALM BEACH
LOCAL NAME : PALM BEACH COUNTY ROAD NAME :
PROJ LIMITS : SWEEPING - PRIMARY

BID BID TOTAL % OVER
RANK VENDOR NAME TYPE STATUS BID LOW BID
1 INTERNATIONAL SWEEPING, INC. DBA WINNING BID $ 103,623.30 0.00%
2 TRIPPLE H INDUSTRIES LLP $ 104,670.00 1.01%
3 SFM SERVICES, INC. $ 116,811.72 12.72%
4 A EXTREME ROAD MAINTENANCE, INC $ 142,351.20 37.37%
5 STAR CLEANING USA, INC. $ 144,444 60 39.39%
6 CENTRAL SWEEPING SERVICE $ 147,961.51 42 .78%
7 MAGIC CLEANING SERVICE $ 149,678.10 44 . 44%
8 ENVIRONMENTAL PERFORMANCE $ 149,887.44 44 .64%
9 US GROUNDS INC $ 152,399.52 47 .07%
10 KNIGHT PROPERTY MANAGEMENT SERV $ 157,005.00 51.51%
11 DE ANGELO BROTHERS, INC. T/A AQUAGENIX, INC. $ 175,008.24 68.88%
12 FLORIDA SWEEPING INC REJECTED NO BID BOND $ 184,219.20 77.77%
13 SOUTH FLORIDA BUSHOG SERVICES, $ 207,246 .60 100 %

THE COMPUTER CALCULATED TOTAL BID PRICE IS THE OFFICIAL BID RESULTS TOTAL.ANY BIDDER WHO FEELS ADVERSELY AFFECTED BY THE DEPARTMENT'S DECISION ON THIS PROJECT MUST FILE WITH THE CLERK OF
AGENCYPROCEEDINGS, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 605 SUWANNEE STREET, ROOM 550, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0458, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF PROTEST WITHIN 72 HOURS OF POSTED NOTICE.
ADDITIONALLY, A FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST SETTING FORTH A SHORT AND PLAIN STATEMENT OF THE MATTERS ASSERTED BY THE BIDDER MUST BE FILED WITH THE CLERK OF AGENCY PROCEEDINGS WITHIN 10 DAYS OF
THE PRELIMINARY NOTICE OF PROTEST. IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 337.11, FLORIDA STATUES 120.57(3), AND DOT RULE 14-110 F.A.C., FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING AN AWARD SHALL POST WITH THE
DEPARTMENT, AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE LOWEST BID SUBMITTED WHICH BOND SHALL BE
CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT
PROCEEDINGS. FOR AN ACTION PROTESTING A BID REJECTION, OR CONTRACT AWARD THAT DOES NOT REQUIRE QUALIFICATION OF BIDDERS, THE BOND SHALL BE $2,500.00.FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME
PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHERSECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF
PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. THIS NOTICE IS NOT INTENDED AS AN ACCEPTANCE OF ANY OFFER CREATED BY SUBMISSION OF A BID, AND NO CONTRACT SHALL BE CONSIDERED TO EXIST UNTIL
REDUCED TO WRITING AND EXECUTED BY ALL PARTIES THERETO.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO. AWARD WAS POSTED: 11amon 2/2/10 Lizz Holmes, Procurement Supervisor



FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE

CALL ORDER
LETTING DATE
SET-ASIDE
CONTRACT TIME

006 PROPOSAL
01/22/10 11:00 AM DISTRICT

U/R CODE
365 CALENDAR DAYS

FINPROJ(S) 40419747201 (%) F.A. NO.
40419847201
LOCAL NAME PALM BEACH COUNTY

PROJ LIMITS

RANK VENDOR NAME

VENDOR RANKING

1D

DRAIN CLEANING PRIMARY

E4L03-RO
04

NZ7A
NZA

: 01723710
PAGE : 006 -1

PROPOSAL DESC :
Cleaning, videoing, evaluating and repairing leaks in
Drainage systems on the primary roads in Palm Beach County.

The bid bond and award amount shall be based on the maximum

limiting amount of $390,000 and not the contractor®s bid
total.

COUNTIES : PALM BEACH

F. A. JOHNSON, INC. WINNING BID
ROCKLINE VAC SYSTEMS, INC.
SHENANDOAH GENERAL CONSTRUCTION
AMERICAN POWER RODDING, CORP.
PHOENIX HAYES, INC.

W.W. ENGINEERING, INC.

O~NOUTAWN -

REYNOLDS INLINER, LLC

ENVIRONMENTAL PERFORMANCE REJECTED NO BID BOND

ROAD NAME :

BID BID TOTAL % OVER

TYPE STATUS BID LOW BID
$ 232,641.00 0.00%
$ 264,692.50 13.77%
$ 287,016.30 23.37%
$ 307,230.00 32.06%
$ 447,500.00 92.35%
$ 476,340.00 104 %
$ 514,290.00 121 %
$ 516,500.00 122 %

THE COMPUTER CALCULATED TOTAL BID PRICE IS THE OFFICIAL BID RESULTS TOTAL.ANY BIDDER WHO FEELS ADVERSELY AFFECTED BY THE DEPARTMENT'S DECISION ON THIS PROJECT MUST FILE WITH THE CLERK OF
AGENCYPROCEEDINGS, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 605 SUWANNEE STREET, ROOM 550, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0458, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF PROTEST WITHIN 72 HOURS OF POSTED NOTICE.
ADDITIONALLY, A FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST SETTING FORTH A SHORT AND PLAIN STATEMENT OF THE MATTERS ASSERTED BY THE BIDDER MUST BE FILED WITH THE CLERK OF AGENCY PROCEEDINGS WITHIN 10 DAYS OF
THE PRELIMINARY NOTICE OF PROTEST. IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 337.11, FLORIDA STATUES 120.57(3), AND DOT RULE 14-110 F.A.C., FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING AN AWARD SHALL POST WITH THE
DEPARTMENT, AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE LOWEST BID SUBMITTED WHICH BOND SHALL BE
CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT
PROCEEDINGS. FOR AN ACTION PROTESTING A BID REJECTION, OR CONTRACT AWARD THAT DOES NOT REQUIRE QUALIFICATION OF BIDDERS, THE BOND SHALL BE $2,500.00.FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME
PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHERSECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF
PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. THIS NOTICE IS NOT INTENDED AS AN ACCEPTANCE OF ANY OFFER CREATED BY SUBMISSION OF A BID, AND NO CONTRACT SHALL BE CONSIDERED TO EXIST UNTIL

REDUCED TO WRITING AND EXECUTED BY ALL PARTIES THERETO.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD WAS POSTED: 11amon 2/2/10 Lizz Holmes, Procurement Supervisor



FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE : 01/23/10

“REVISED POSTING” PAGE : 002 -1
VENDOR RANKING

CALL ORDER : 002 PROPOSAL ID : E4LO5 PROPOSAL DESC :

LETTING DATE : 01/22/10 11:00 AM DISTRICT 104 Mowing and litter removal on 1-95 from the northside of the

SET-ASIDE : U/R CODE : Earman River to the Martin/Palm Beach County Line.

CONTRACT TIME : 365 CALENDAR DAYS

Contract Coordinator: Margaret S. x 4612

FINPROJ(S) : 42762917201 (%) F.A. NO. : N/A COUNTIES : PALM BEACH

LOCAL NAME : PALM BEACH COUNTY ROAD NAME :

PROJ LIMITS  MOWING IN 1-95 NORTH OF NORTHLAKE BLVD

BID BID TOTAL % OVER

RANK VENDOR NAME TYPE STATUS BID LOW BID
1 SOUTH FLORIDA BUSHOG SERVICES, WITHDREW BID $ 85,347.90 0.00%
2 KNIGHT PROPERTY MANAGEMENT SERV WINNING BID $ 124,630.18 46.02%
3 A QUALITY BUSHOG SERVICES INC $ 140,732.10 64 .89%
4 NEXTERA LANDSCAPING $ 149,114 .40 74.71%
5 EDEN LANDSCAPING, INC. $ 149,746.50 75.45%
6 GREENSCAPES INC., OF SOUTH FL $ 149,999.67 75.75%
7 GRADING & BUSH HOG SERVICES IN $ 155,316.00 81.97%
8 J.D. SUNNY ISLE INC. REJECTED NO BID BOND $ 182,948.00 114 %

THE COMPUTER CALCULATED TOTAL BID PRICE IS THE OFFICIAL BID RESULTS TOTAL.ANY BIDDER WHO FEELS ADVERSELY AFFECTED BY THE DEPARTMENT'S DECISION ON THIS PROJECT MUST FILE WITH THE
CLERK OF AGENCYPROCEEDINGS, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 605 SUWANNEE STREET, ROOM 550, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0458, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF PROTEST WITHIN 72 HOURS OF
POSTED NOTICE. ADDITIONALLY, A FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST SETTING FORTH A SHORT AND PLAIN STATEMENT OF THE MATTERS ASSERTED BY THE BIDDER MUST BE FILED WITH THE CLERK OF AGENCY
PROCEEDINGS WITHIN 10 DAYS OF THE PRELIMINARY NOTICE OF PROTEST. IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 337.11, FLORIDA STATUES 120.57(3), AND DOT RULE 14-110 F.A.C., FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST
WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION
PROTESTING AN AWARD SHALL POST WITH THE DEPARTMENT, AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO ONE PERCENT (1%) OF
THE LOWEST BID SUBMITTED WHICH BOND SHALL BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HIM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS
BROUGHT AND ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT PROCEEDINGS. FOR AN ACTION PROTESTING A BID REJECTION, OR CONTRACT AWARD THAT DOES NOT REQUIRE QUALIFICATION OF BIDDERS, THE BOND
SHALL BE $2,500.00.FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHERSECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE
TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. THIS NOTICE IS NOT INTENDED AS AN ACCEPTANCE OF ANY OFFER CREATED BY
SUBMISSION OF A BID, AND NO CONTRACT SHALL BE CONSIDERED TO EXIST UNTIL REDUCED TO WRITING AND EXECUTED BY ALL PARTIES THERETO.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD WAS POSTED: 2pmon 2/2/10 Lizz Holmes, Procurement Supervisor
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FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE : 01/23/10
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VENDOR RANKING

CALL ORDER : 003 PROPOSAL ID : E4LQO7-RO PROPOSAL DESC
LETTING DATE : 01/22/10 11:00 AM DISTRICT : 04 I-95 & portions of I-595: Mechanical Sweeping in Broward
SET-ASIDE : U/R CODE : County. The estimated budget is $250,000.
This contract has a renewal option.
CONTRACT TIME : 365 CALENDAR DAYS
FINPROJ(S) t 40339647201 (*) F.A. NO. : N/A COUNTIES : BROWARD
LOCAL NAME : I-95 BROWARD COUNTY ROAD NAME
PROJ LIMITS : SWEEPING
BID BID TOTAL % OVER
RANK VENDOR NAME TYPE STATUS BID LOW BID
1 A EXTREME ROAD MAINTENANCE, INC S 128,975.00 0.00%
2 SFM SERVICES, INC. s 142,693.25 10.63%
3 ENVIRONMENTAL PERFORMANCE B 143,338.13 L1 3%
4 TRIPPLE H INDUSTRIES LLP $ 146,562.50 13.63%
5 MAGIC CLEANING SERVICE S 149,786.88 16.13%
6 INTERNATIONAL SWEEPING,INC. DBA ECTED NO BID B $ 158,287.50 22.72%
7 US GROUNDS INC S 163,856.88 27.04%
8 COMMUNITY ASPHALT CORP. $ 193,462.50 50.00%
9 CENTRAL SWEEPING SERVICE S 195,866.13 51.86%
10 SOUTH FLORIDA BUSHOG SERVICES, $ 219,843.75 70.45%
11 STAR CLEANING USA, INC. REJECTED NO BID BOND $ 222,423.25 72.45%
12 DE ANGELO BROTHERS, INC. T/A AQUAGENIX, INC. $ 225,706.25 75.00%
13 KNIGHT PROPERTY MANAGEMENT SERV s 250,621.88 94.31%
14 FLORIDA SWEEPING INC REJECTED HNO BID BOND $ 257,950.00 100 %

THE COMPUTER CALCULATED TOTAL BID PRICE IS THE OFFICIAL BID RESULTS TOTAL.ANY BIDDER WHO FEELS ADVERSELY AFFECTED BY THE DEPARTMENT'S DECISION ON THIS PROJECT MUST FILE WITH THE CLERK OF
AGENCYPROCEEDINGS, FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION, 605 SUWANNEE STREET, ROOM 550, TALLAHASSEE, FL 32399-0458, A WRITTEN NOTICE OF PROTEST WITHIN 72 HOURS OF POSTED NOTICE.
ADDITIONALLY, A FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST SETTING FORTH A SHORT AND PLAIN STATEMENT OF THE MATTERS ASSERTED BY THE BIDDER MUST BE FILED WITH THE CLERK OF AGENCY PROCEEDINGS WITHIN 10 DAYS OF
THE PRELIMINARY NOTICE OF PROTEST. IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 337.11, FLORIDA STATUES 120.57(3}, AND DOT RULE 14-110 f.A.C., FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION
120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN ACTION PROTESTING AN AWARD SHALL POST WITH THE
DEPARTMENT, AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMAL WRITTEN PROTEST, A BOND PAYABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO ONE PERCENT (1%) OF THE LOWEST BID SUBMITTED WHICH BOND SHALL BE
CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDGED AGAINST HiM IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING IN WHICH THE ACTION IS BROUGHT AND ANY SUBSEQUENT APPELLATE COURT
PROCEEDINGS. FOR AN ACTION PROTESTING A BID REJECTION, OR CONTRACT AWARD THAT DOES NOT REQUIRE QUALIFICATION OF BIDDERS, THE BOND SHALL BE $2,500.00.FAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME
PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3), FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHERSECURITY REQUIRED BY LAW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF
PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. THIS NOTICE IS NOT INTENDED AS AN ACCEPTANCE OF ANY OFFER CREATED BY SUBMISSION OF A BID, AND NO CONTRACT SHALL BE CONSIDERED TO EXIST UNTIL
REDUCED TO WRITING AND EXECUTED BY ALL PARTIES THERETO.

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD WAS POSTED: DATE: 5 \ z r\\ 2010
TIME: [Z:00 fm
BY: x Z §§
tizz Hotkr, cpp

Procurement Supervisor





